

EXHIBIT 2 - PRICING SUBMITTAL
Marubeni

TRANSPORTATION APPROVED ITEMS:

NOTE: "Any adjuvant used shall state the percentage effective ingredient, as well as the percentage ineffective, on the adjuvant products' label"

ITEM	CATEGORY	EPA#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT OF MEASURE	NOTES	PRICE
1000028189	ADJUVANT	NA	ADJUVANT: CORRAL POLY, Liquid,Drift Control,QT Polyvinyl Polymer(polyacrylamide), minimum 30%. Compatible with Glyphosate. 1 qt container	QUART	PointBlank WM, 1 quart	\$13.50
1000028190	ADJUVANT	NA	ADJUVANT: (Liquid Drift Control), CONTROL,Liquid,Qt,Drift Control Adjuvant. Active Ingredient: Polyvinyl Polymer (Polyacrylamide), minimum 37.0%. Compatible with Glyphosate. 1 qt container	QUART	Promate Accuracy, 1 quart	\$10.80
1000004125	ADJUVANT	NA	ADJUVANT: (Dry Ammonium Sulfate), APF AMS,Dry,51lb Bg,AMMONIUM SULFATE (Sprayable grade). Active Ingredient: Ammonium Sulfate 99.5%. To be used with Landmaster BW herbicide.	BAG	APF AMS 51 pound bag	\$13.65
1000002229	HERBICIDE	62719-519	HERBICIDE:MILESTONE VM,Liquid,Qt, Active Ingredients: Triisopropanolammonium salt of 2-pyridine carboxylic acid, 4-amino-3, 6-dichloro-, 40.6%. Inert Ingredients: 59.4%	QUART	container	\$80.25
1000031341	HERBICIDE	62719-259	HERBICIDE: TRANSLINE, Liquid, 2.5gal, Active Ingredient: clopyralid: 3,6-dichloro-2-pyridinecarboxylic acid, monoethanolamine salt, 40.9%. Inert Ingredients: 59.1%	EACH	Transline 2.5gal container	\$382.00
1000002414	HERBICIDE	228-397	HERBICIDE:VANQUISH,Liquid,2.5gal, Active Ingredient: Diglycolamine Salt of 3,6-Dichloro-O-Anisic Acid, 56.8%. Inert Ingredients. 43.2%	EACH	Clash 2.5 gal conatainerfrom Nufarm	\$89.50
1000031342	HERBICIDE	7969-150	HERBICIDE: OVERDRIVE, Dry, 7.5lb, Active Ingredients: Sodium salt of difufenzopyr: 2-(1-[(3.5-difluorophenylamine)carbonyl)-hydrazono]ethyl)-3-pyridinecarboxylic acid,sodium salt 21.3% & Sodium salt of dicamba:3,6-dichloro-0-anisic acid	EACH	Overdrive 7.5lb container	\$355.15

ITEM	CATEGORY	EPA#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT OF MEASURE		NOTES	PRICE
1000002189	HERBICIDE	42750-62	HERBICIDE:LANDMASTER BW,Liquid,2.5gal, Active Ingredients: Glyphosate:(N-(Phosphonomethly))glycine, in form of isopropylamine salt, 12.9%, & 2, 4-D: 2,4-dichlorophenoxyacetic acid, in the form of its isopropylamine salt, 20.6%. Inert Ingredients: 66.5%	EACH		Landmaster BW, 2.5 gal container	\$49.62
ranger	HERBICIDE	524-517	HERBICIDE:RANGER PRO,Liquid,30gal, Active Ingredients: Glyphosate, N-(phosphonomethyl)glycine, in the form of its isopropylamine salt, 41%. Inert Ingredients: 59.0%.	EACH		Ranger Pro 30 gal container	\$439.50
1000002817	HERBICIDE	524-529	HERBICIDE:ROUNDUP PRO CONCENTRATE,Liquid,2.5gal, Active Ingredient: Glysohphate,N-(Phosphonomethyl) Glycine, in the form of its isopropylamine salt 50.2%. Inert Ingredients: 49.8%.	EACH		Roundup Pro Concentrate, 2.5 gal container	\$46.05
1000012307	HERBICIDE	241-365	HERBICIDE: IMAZAPIC , PLATEAU, 1 ga ch	GALLON		Plateau 1 gal container	\$99.90
1000031338	HERBICIDE	432-1549	HERBICIDE:ESCORT XP, Dry, 16oz, Active Ingredient: Metsulfuron Methyl: Methyl 2-[[[(4-methoxy-6-methyl-1,3,5-triazin-2-yl)amino]carbonyl]ammino)sulfonyl]benzoate, 60.0%. Inert Ingredients: 40.0%	EACH		Escort XP, 16oz container	\$28.64
1000004723	HERBICIDE	19713-42	HERBICIDE: MSMA 6 Plus, Liquid,2.5gal, Active Ingredients: Monosodium acid methanearsonate, 47.6%. Inert Ingredients: 52.4%	EACH		Target 6 Plus 2.5 gal container	\$61.85
1000012329	HERBICIDE	62719-17	HERBICIDE:TORDON K,Liquid,1gal, Active Ingredients: picloram: 4-amino-3,5,6-trichloropicolinic acid, potassium salt, 24.4%. Inert Ingredients: 75.6%.	GALLON		Tordon 22K 1 gal container	\$80.05
1000004631	HERBICIDE	59639-223	HERBICIDE:OUTRIDER,DRY,20oz, Active Ingredient: Sulfosulfuron: 1-(2-Ethysulfonylmidazo [1,2-A]Pyridin-3-Ylsulfonyl)-3(4,6-Dimethoxypyrimidin-2-yl)urea, 75%. Inert Ingredient: 25%.	EACH		Outrider, 20oz container	\$271.00
1000031339	HERBICIDE	432-1552	HERBICIDE: OUST XP, Dry, 3lb , Active Ingredient: Sulfometuron methyl: Methyl 2-[[[(4,6-Dimethyl-2Pyrimidinyl)amino]-carbonyl]amino)sulfonyl]benzoate, 75%. Inert Ingredients: 25%	EACH		Oust XP, 3lb container	\$82.50
1000031340	HERBICIDE	432-1557	HERBICIDE: OUST EXTRA, Dry, 4lb , Active Ingredients: Sulfometuron methyl: Methyl 2-[[[(4,6-Dimethyl-2Pyrimidinyl)amino]-carbonyl]amino)sulfonyl]benzoate 56.25%, & Metsulfuron methyl: 15%. Inert Ingr. :28.75%	EACH		Oust Extra, 4lb container	\$108.44

ITEM	CATEGORY	EPA#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT OF MEASURE	NOTES	PRICE
1000031345	HERBICIDE	62719-527	HERBICIDE: GARLON 4 ULTRA, Liquid, 2.5gal, Active Ingredient: triclopyr: 3,5,6-trichloro-2-pyridinyloxyacetic acid, butoxyethyl ester, 60.45%. Inert Ingredients: 39.55%	EACH	Garlon 4 Ultra, 2.5 gal container	\$188.00
1000031347	HERBICIDE	432-1516	HERBICIDE: ESPLANADE, Liquid, 1 quart & 2.5 Gallon, Active Ingredient: Indaziflam (CAS No: 730979-19-8) 19.05%. Inert Ingredients: 80.95%.	EACH	Esplanade 200SC, 1 quart container	\$415.36
1000031344	HERBICIDE	62719-37	HERBICIDE: Liquid, 2.5gal, Active Ingredient: triclopyr: 3,5,6-trichloro-2-pyridinyloxyacetic acid, triethylamine salt, 44.4%. Inert Ingredients: 55.6%	EACH	Garlon 3A, 2.5 gal container	\$101.25
1000002739	WEED KILLER	66222-89	WEED KILLER-Dry:3lb bag-65% - Prodiamine: [N3, N3-Di-n-propyl-2,4-dinitro-6-(trifluoromethyl)-m-phenylenediamine]~Weed killers (herbicides) dry Active Ingredients: 65% - Prodiamine: [N3, N3-Di-n-propyl-2,4-dinitro-6-(trifluoromethyl)-m-phenylenediamine]	EACH	Alligare Prodiamine 65 WG, 5lb container	\$68.75
1000028232	WEED KILLER	241-426	WEED KILLER:HABITAT, Liq-2.5GA Imazapyr Isopropylamine saltImazapyr Isopropylamine salt of Imazapyr(2-[4,5-dihydro-4-methyl-4-(1-methylethyl)-5-oxo-1H-imidazol-2-yl]-3-pyri~Imazapyr. Active Ingredients: Isopropylamine salt of Imazapyr(2-[4,5-dihydro-4-met	EACH	Habitat, 2.5 gal container	\$243.38
1000002621	WEED KILLER	524-5817	WEED KILLER:Dry/GLYPHOSATE/2.5 Gal	EACH	Ranger Pro, 2.5 gal container	\$40.75
1000023977	WEED KILLER	241-346	WEED KILLER-Liq:1 Gal ARSENAL,Imazapyr Isopropylamine salt of Imazapyr(2-[4,5-dihydro-4-methyl-4-(1-methylethyl)-5-oxo-1H-imidazol-2-yl]-3-pyri~Imazapyr. Active Ingredients: Isopropylamine salt of Imazapyr(2-[4,5-dihydro-4-methyl-4-(1-methylethyl)-5-oxo-	GALLON	Ecomazapyr 2SL, 2.5 gal container	\$142.88
1000023356	WEED KILLER	432-1567	WEED KILLER:PASTORA,Dry, 20oz, Active Ingredients: Nicosulfuron, 2-[[[(4,6-dimethoxypyrimidin-2-yl)aminocarbonyl]aminosulfonyl]-N,N-dimethyl-3-pyridinecarboxamide, 56.2% & Metsulfuron Methyl, , 15.0%. Inert Ingredients: 28.8%.	EACH	Pastora, 20oz container	\$342.00
1000004681	WEED KILLER	NA	WEED KILLER-Dry:NON-IONIC SURFACTANT, Aquatic approved. Active Ingredients: 80%. Inert Ingredients: 20%. Non-Ionic. To be used wit~NON-IONIC SURFACTANT, Aquatic approved. Active Ingredients: 80%. Inert Ingredients: 20%. Non-Ionic.	GALLON	Ad-Spray 80, per gallon	\$12.35

ITEM	CATEGORY	EPA#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT OF MEASURE	NOTES	PRICE
1000002453	OTHER	NA	NON-IONIC SURFACTANT(Aquatic Approved):RRSI NIS,Liquid,1gal, Active Ingredients: Alkylarylpoethylene glycols, free fatty acids 90%. Inactive Iredients: Components ineffective as an adjuvant 10%. To be used with aquatic approved herbicides.	GALLON	Induce per gallon. Only true 90% surfactant on approved list. Other products include water as an active ingredient, Induce does not include water as an active ingredient.	\$22.15
OTHER HERBICIDE, INSECTICIDES, AND FUNGICIDES						
ITEM	CATEGORY	EPA#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT OF MEASURE	NOTES	PRICE
10171701	HERBICIDE		SPECTICLE FLO (INDAXIFLAM 7.4%)	GALLON		\$777.65
10171701	HERBICIDE		NEGATE 27WG (METSULFURON 20%,RIMSULFURON 16.67%)	BOTTLE		\$37.50
10171701	HERBICIDE		CERTAINTY (SULFOSULFURON 85%)	BOTTLE		\$88.00
10171701	HERBICIDE		STRIKE THREE (2,4-D MECOPROP-P, DICAMBA	BOTTLE		\$90.00
10171701	HERBICIDE		REVOLVER (ORAMSULFURON 2.34%	QUART		\$287.77
10171701	HERBICIDE		RONSTAR G (OXADIAZON 2%)	BAG (50 LB)		No Bid
10171701	HERBICIDE		AQUASHADE LIQUID-BLUE DYE	GALLON		\$43.95
10171701	HERBICIDE		BIO ADVANCED FIRE ANT KILLER POWDER	EACH		No Bid
10171701	HERBICIDE		CITRIC ACID-FOOD GRADE ASHYDROUS PURE FINE GRANULAR	50 LB PAIL		No Bid
10171701	HERBICIDE		CLIPPER-FLUMIOXAZIN	5 LB CONTAINER	Semera	\$175.00
10171701	HERBICIDE		COPPER SULFATE-FINE CRYSTAL 99% PURE	50 LB BAG		No Bid
10171701	HERBICIDE		CUTRINE PLUS - LIQUID	GALLON		\$36.00
10171701	HERBICIDE		REWARD/TRIBUNE-DIQUAT	GALLON		\$102.00
10171701	HERBICIDE		CAPTAIN XTR 0 LIQUID COPPER ALGAECIDE	GALLON		\$40.00
10171701	HERBICIDE		CUTRINE PLUS - GRANULAR	BAG (30 LB)		\$72.00
10171701	HERBICIDE		PHOSLOCK	BAG (55 LB)		No Bid
10171600	FERTILIZER		12-3-12 CONTEC DG	EACH		No Bid
10171600	FERTILIZER		18-9-18 CONTECT DG	EACH		No Bid
10171600	FERTILIZER		0-0-25 CONTECT DG	EACH		No Bid
10171600	FERTILIZER		GRAVITY 5-0-0	EACH		No Bid
10171600	FERTILIZER		GRAVITY 12-0-0	EACH		No Bid
10171600	FERTILIZER		PRIMO MAXX	EACH		\$317.00

ITEM	CATEGORY	EPA#	DESCRIPTION	UNIT OF MEASURE	NOTES	PRICE
10171600	FERTILIZER		FORTE	EACH		No Bid
10171600	FERTILIZER		DEHYDRATED ALFALFA PELLETS	BAG (50LB)		No Bid
10171600	FERTILIZER		COTTONSEED MEAL	BAG (50LB)		No Bid
10191509	INSECTICIDE		PROVAUANT WDG (INDOXACARB)	4.5lb bag		\$453.60
10191509	INSECTICIDE		ACELEPRYN SC (CHLORANTRANILIPROLE 18.4%)	0.5 GALLON		\$966.50
10191509	INSECTICIDE		ALOFT (CLOTHIANIDIN 24.7%, BIFENTHRIN 12.3%)	0.5 GALLON		\$568.25
10191509	INSECTICIDE		SCIMITAR GC (LAMBDA-CYHALOTHRIN 9.7%)	QUART		\$161.25
10191509	INSECTICIDE		TALSTAR PROFESSIONAL (BIFENTHRIN 7.9%)	GALLON		\$55.00
10191509	INSECTICIDE		TALSTAR SELECT (BIFENTHRIN 7.9%)	GALLON		\$65.00
10171702	FUNGICIDES		DACONIL (CHLOROTHALONIL 82.5%)	5 LB BAG		\$94.45
10171702	FUNGICIDES		FORE 80WP RAINSHIELD (MANCOZEB 80%)	1.5 LB BAG		\$14.60
10171702	FUNGICIDES		BAYLETON (TRIADIMEFON 50%)	5.5 OZ PACKAGE		No Bid
10171702	FUNGICIDES		PROSTAR 70 WG (FLUTOLANIL 70%)	3 LB CONTAINER		No Bid
10171702	FUNGICIDES		VELISTA WDG (PENTHIOPYRAD 50%)	22 OZ BOTTLE		\$286.00
10171702	FUNGICIDES		HERITAGE (AZOXYSTROBIN 50%)	1 LB BOTTLE		\$367.00
10171702	FUNGICIDES		SEGWAY (CYAZOFAMID 34.5%)	40 OZ BOTTLE		\$326.30
10171702	FUNGICIDES		SUBDUE MAXX (MEFENOXAM 22%)	QUART		\$162.95
10171702	FUNGICIDES		TERRAZOLE 35WP (ETRIDIAZOLE 35%)	2 LB BAG		No Bid
10171702	FUNGICIDES		LEXICON (FLUXAPYROXAD 14.33%)	21 OUNCE BOTTLE		\$630.00
AQUATIC APPROVED DISINFECTANT & CLEANERS						
1000002216	AQUATIC		MURIATIC ACID (HYDROCHLORIC ACID)	GALLON		No Bid
47101605	AQUATIC		VIRKON AQUATIC (VIRUCIDE/DISINFECTANT POWDER	10 LB CONTAINER		No Bid
MISC WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS						
70101500	FISH HEALTH		HALAMID AQUA (CHLORAMINE-T) POWDER	11 LB CONTAINER		No Bid
70101500	FISH HEALTH		KORDON OR POLYAQUA POND FISH PROTECTOR	1 GALLON CONTAINER		No Bid
70101500	FISH HEALTH		NO-FOAM (20% SILICONE BASE)	1 GALLON CONTAINER		No Bid
70101500	FISH HEALTH		POTASSIUM PERMAGANATE			No Bid
70101500	FISH HEALTH		WHITE SALT BLOCK (ANIMAL FEEDING)	50 LB BLOCK		No Bid
70101500	FISH HEALTH		WHITE LOOSE AGRICULTURAL STOCK SALT	50 LB BAG		No Bid