SW0003 Water Treatment Chemicals
Event EV00000506
EXHIBIT 02: Price Sheet

Instructions:

, Suppl , Unit Cost, Ext. Cost, Lead Time, and any Comments you may have.
Note#1: | Any P be added at the bottom under *value-added"
— —
tem i catcp tem Description Qv | UOM | Freight Terms | hip Via J Brand Name Manufacture # | supplier Part #__| Minimum Order Unit Cost__|Ext. Cost Lead Time Supplier Remarks
1 47101600 1000010856 | CHLORINE: 10lb, Algiide and Siocide organic doner 10 o FoBDEST | common | No sid
2 47101601 1000003891 | CHOR 50 10 s Fospest | common fno Bid
3 47101600 1000010857 | CHLORINE: 10015, Algcide and Biocide, organic doner 10 s FoBDEST | common | No Bid
4 47101600 1000010858 | ACID:S0lb, Sulfamic 10 86 Fospest | common fno Bid
B 47101600 1000010859 [ ACiD:15ga, Sulfuric 10 o FoBDEST | common | Mid-America Chemical 71215 415015 |$400 combination of products | $ 15000 | $  1,500.00 |3-5 working days
6 47101600 1000010850 | ACID:S0ga, Sulfuric 10 oR FoBDEST | coMMON | Mid-America Chemical 71255 415055 |$400 combination of products | $  295.00 | $  2,950.00 |3-5 working days
5 41101013 1000002751 | DIOXIDE:Sulfur Dioxide,liquifed. 1501 bils~Sulfur Dioxide, 10 o rosoest | common v eid
liquified. 150 b botties
WATER TREAT CHEM: 5 Gal DrumHydroxide soda, iquid sodium
9 47101608 1000004680 {(50%) rayon grade for use n boiler and ion ex-changer 10 oA FoB DEST | common | Mid-America Chemical 71305 385001 |$400 combination of products | $ 2500 | $  250.00 e Memby de. Unit cost s per gallon
regeneration 5 gal/drumS GAL/DRUM
WATER TREAT CHEM: 55 Gal Drum-Hydroxide soda, liquid
10 47101604 1000004654 | sodium (50%) rayon grade for use in boiler and ion ex-changer | 10 = F0BDEST | coMMON f Mid-America Chemical 71355 69665 | $400 combination of products | $ 691 |$ 6910 Memby d gallon
regeneration 55 gallon
1 47101608 1000003283 [ PHOSPHATES: Mono phosphates 100 pound carton 10 o FoBDEST | common | No sid
12 47101604 1000003332 (PHOSPHATES: Disodium phosphates 100 pound carton 10 o Fospest | common fno Bid
13 47101608 1000002091 [ PHOSPHATES: Tri sodium phosphates 100 pound carton 10 o FoBDEST | common | No sid
1 47101600 1000010861 | CHLORINE: 100ib, Liquid 10 H FOBDEST | common | No Bid
15 47101600 1000010862 | CHLORINE: 15015, Liquid 10 o FoBDEST | common | No Bid
1 47101600 1000010863 | SODIUM: Hexametaphosate, 100 Ib 10 o FOBDEST | common flNo Bid
Y 30111604 1000010864 | LIME: S0l Hydrated 10 86 FoBDEST | common | No sid
18 47101600 1000010865 | ASH: 50Ib, Soda 10 86 FoBDesT | common fl Genesis Alkali NA 373050 $400 combination of products | $  67.00 | $ 67000 |3-5 working days
19 51171508 1000010866 [SODIUM: 50lb, Bicarbonate 10 [ FoBDEST | common flronox WA 366050 $400 combination of products | $  67.00 | $ 67000 |3-5 working days
20 47101600 1000010857 | SODIUM: 30gs, Hypochlorite 10 oR FoBDEST | comMMON | Mid-America Chemical 71930 252030 |$400 combination of products | $ 217.50 | $  2,175.00 |3-5 working days
2 47101600 1000010868 | SODIUM: 553, Hypochlorite 10 oR FoBDEST | common | Mid-America Chemical 71955 252055 |$400 combination of products | $ 34375 | $  3,437.50 |3-5 working days
2 47101600 1000010859 | SODIUM: 2000ga,min, Hypochlorite 10 = fospest | common fno Bid
2 12164102 1000007891 Q“‘”f“c’ssz"‘l'”“”“’/5“Ga"“"“““"“"‘““'“ (5% 10 oA FoB DEST | common | Mid-America Chemical 71355 69665 $400 combination of products | § 691 (S 6910 |35 working days Unit cost s per gallon
solution) 50 gal.
u 47101600 1000010901 5‘/‘5‘;" o0t Powder, Caldum Hypochlorite 6% cacium 10 cH fospest | common f axial NiA 146010| 5400 combination of products | § 316,00 | §  3,160.00 |3-5 working days Granular. Unit cost s per container
2 47101600 1000010870 {SODIUM: 558, Liquid, hypochlorite 12.5% 10 oR FoBDEST | commoN | Mid-America Chemical 72055 252400 |$400 combination of products | $ 34375 | $  3,437.50 |3-5 working days
% 47101600 1000010871 {SOLUTION: 330ga, Hypochlorite 12.5% 10 e FoBDEST | comMMON | Mid-America Chemical 72330 252500 $400 combination of products | $ 1,732.50 | § 17,325.00 |3-5 working days
2 47101601 1000002450 | CALCIUM: Calcium hypochlorite 1004 plastic drum 10 A FoBDEST | comvion fl axial WA 146010( $400 combination of products [ § 316,00 | §  3,160.00 |3-5 working days Granular. Unit costis per container
3 47101601 1000002934 [ CHLORINE: Organic chiorine donar bromine 501 10 86 FOBDEST | common | No Bid
29 47101601 1000004616 | WATER TREAT CHEM: 100#~Organic chiorine donar bromine 10 [ FoBDEST | common | No Bid
- 7101501 100004755 | WATERTREAT 5 Ga-plymerc qstenary i s 1 e cosoest | common fno sid
gallon
e 47101600 1000010872 [ CHLORINE:Tablets,3, 5%, 50 /PA 10 PA FoBDEST | common | No sid
TER TREAT CHEM: 507, Bromine
3 7101501 1000003773 | TreatmentBromine sanitizer for swimming pool treatment, 0 - rosoest | common v sid
tablets, 504 Container~Bromine sanitizr for swimming pool
3 01601 1000003793 | WATER TREAT CHEM: 100, Bromine Sanitizerfor Pool 0 o cosoest | covmon v aid
Treatment~Bromine sanitzer for swimming pool treatment
3 47101600 1000010873 | SULFATE: Aluminum, 501b, domestic only 10 86 FosDesT | common fl Geo Specialty 230505 106050| $400 combination of products [ § 7250 [ § 725,00 |3-5 working days
35 47101600 1000010876 | SALT: S0lb, Pelleted, 99% 10 86 FoBDEST | common f southwest salt NIA 1922192 Pallet Minimum, 49 bags perpal| $  9.36 [ S 93.60 |35 working days
36 47101600 1000010877 [ SALT: 80lb, Pelleted, 99%, min 20 tons 10 o FoBDEsT | common f United Salt N/A 192623 |2 Pallet Minimum, 49 bags perpal| $ 1136 [ §  113.60 |35 working days 501b bags. 20 tons min does not apply.
37 47101600 1000010878 [ SALT: 80lb, Pelleted 9%, min 25 tons 10 o F0BDEST | cOMMON f Southwest salt WA 192525 |2 Pallet Minimum, 63 bags perpal| $ 7.4 | 5 74.80 |35 working days 401b bags. 25 tons min does not apply
B 47101600 1000010879 | SALT: Bulk, Pelleted 99%, 10 6 FOBDEST | comMON | No Bid
3 01601 onaonizey | WATERTREAT CHEM 30 GarPlymeric uatemary amona 0 0 o cosoest | covmon v aid
gallon
o 12163901 1000004599 | WATER TREAT CHEM: Cool Twr /5 Gal~scale dispersant (maleic | ;o @ cosoest | covmton v aig
copolymer); 30% active, or more 5 gallons
" 12163901 1000003071 | WATER TREAT CHEM: Caol Twr/30 GalScale dispersant (maleic | o @ cosoest | covmon o bid
copolymer); 30% active, or more 30 gallons
2 12163901 1000002421 | WATER TREAT CHEM: Cool Twr/50 GalScale dispersant (maleic | o @ cosoest | covmton v aig
copolymer); 30% active, or more 50 gallons
- 12163901 1000003775 | WATER TREAT CHEM: Cool Twr /5 Gal~Corrosion/scale inhibitor | ;o I~ cosoest | covmon v aid
(maleic terpolymer/tolyoltrizol acid base); 40% active 5 gallons.
w“ 12163001 1000004338 base; 10 = Fospest | common fno Bid
30 gallons~Corrosion/scale inhibitor
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. 12163901 Ioooootsza | WATER TREAT GHEM Col Tur /50 iﬁl"(}u;r::un/smlz inhibitor | 1o . cosoest | common fno sid
0 asel;
3 47101600 1000010880 | TERPOLYMER: Sga, sodium salt of maleic anhycride 10 cH FoBDEST | common | No sid
a7 47101600 1000010881 | TERPOLYMER:30ga, sodium salt of maleic anhydride 10 cH Fospest | common fno Bid
a8 47101600 1000010882 ( TERPOLYMER: 50ga, sodium salt of maleic anhydride 10 cH FoBDEST | common | No Bid
a9 47101600 1000010883 | RESINS:Sodium ion exchange, cubic foot 10 o FospesT | common fno Bid
B 47101600 1000010884 [RESIN: Cleaner, 48 Ib 10 cH FoBDEsT | common | No sid
5 1101303 1000005094 M\cnoa\)o(m( Microbiocide for drip pans 24 tablet box (s box | 10 . cosoest | covmton v sig
per casel
52 12163600 1000029283 [INMIBITOR: Return lines, Cyclohexylamine, 5 10 A FoBDEST | common | No Bid
53 12163600 1000029284 | INHIBITOR: Return lines, Cyclohexylamine, 50 10 oA FOBDEST | common fINo Bid
54 12163600 1000029285 |INMIBITOR: Return lines, Morpholine, 5 Gallon, 40% 10 A FoBDEST | common | No sid
55 12163600 1000029286 |INHIBITOR: Return lines, Morpholine, 50 Gallon, 40% 10 oA FOBDEST | common fINo Bid
5 7101601 100003as | CALCUM: Clfum Hypocierite, Brauees 100 ponds 10 R rosoest | comvion v sid
per drum
57 47101600 1000010875 | SUNSCREEN: 55ga, Pulsar 20 10 oR Fospest | common fno sid
WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS: Booster Treatment - Pearl
58 47101600 1000031919 | Caustic Soda. Physical State: Solid. Molecular Formula: 10 oR FoBDEST | comvion fl axial WA 383050 $400 combination of products | $  95.00 | $ 95000 |3-5 working days 50Ib bags
NaOHsolubility; soluble in water. PH: 12.7
WATER SOFTENING COMPOUNDS: Tower Pack - Tower Inhibitor.
59 47101610 1000031920 [ Formula: Complex mixture. Physical State: Liquid. Size: 55 galon | 10 oR fospest | common fno sid
drum,
6 47101600 1000031921 | WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS: Sodium Sulfte: Anhydrous. 10 86 FoBDEsT | common f soivay WA 401050 $400 combination of products | $  87.50 | $ 87500 |3-5 working days
Formula: Na2503. Physical State: White Powder. Size: 50 . bag.
Value - Added: | This s the “Value - Added" section. Please feel add Pricing must be g P
— —
tem i catcp tem Description Qv | UOM | Freight Terms | hip Via | Brand Name Manufacture # | Minimum Order R supplier Part # Unit Cost__|Ext. Cost Lead Time Supplier Remarks
1
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