
 

State of Oklahoma 
Department of Central Services 
Central Purchasing 

Statewide Contract Addendum 

 
This addendum is added to and is to be considered part of the subject contract. 

 

Central Purchasing · Will Rogers Office Building (2401 N. Lincoln Boulevard), Suite 116 / P.O. Box 528803 · Oklahoma City, OK 73152-8803 
Telephone: 405/521-2110 · Fax: 405/521-4475 · www.dcs.ok.gov 

 
DCS/PURCHASING - FORM 075 (04/2008) PAGE 1 OF 1 

 

Contract Issuance Date:  11-15-2009 

Statewide Contract #: SW024 

Contract Title: Tires, Tubes and Tire Accessories 

Addendum Date: November 3, 2011 

Addendum #: Five (5) 
 
 
  
 
This contract has been renewed for an additional one year period at the same terms and conditions, this is the 3rd year renewal of a 
four (4) year period.  
 
Contract Period:  11-15-2011 through 11-14-2012 
 
The following vendors have elected to extend their contracts:  
 
 
0000016042 Contract ID# 1951  
Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company  
Akron, OH  
 
0000078120 Contract ID# 1953  
Bridgestone/Firestone North America  
Nashville, TN  
 
0000068061 Contract ID# 1952  
Michelin North America  
Greenville, SC  
 
The following contract for W & W Tire has been amended to include an increase to the Tire Recycling Fee and addition 
of Wheel Alignments. 
 
 
If you have any questions concerning the addendum contact the contracting officer below.  
Theresa Johnson, Contracting Officer  
Telephone #: (405) 521-2289  
Fax #: (405) 522-1078  
  



1 1000009090
TIRES: Farm Tractor, rear, tube type or
tubeless, nylon or polyester, lug tread

1.00          0.00 0.00          0.00

. 
DISCOUNTS: 
 
BRIDGESTONE    LESS 15%

2 1000009091
TIRES: Police Pursuit

1.00          0.00 0.00          0.00

. 
DISCOUNTS: 
 
BRIDGESTONE           45%

3 1000009083
TIRES: Passenger, Radial, All Season
Tread, whitewall, polyester, steel
belts, standard load.

1.00          0.00 0.00          0.00

. 
DISCOUNTS: 
 
BRIDGESTONE     15%

4 1000009092
TIRES: Light Truck, Radial, Steel 
belted, rib tread, blackwall, tubeless,
minimum load range as indicated

1.00          0.00 0.00          0.00

. 
DISCOUNTS: 
 
BRIDGESTONE      15%

5 1000009093
TIRES: Medium Truck/Bus, Radial, all
wheel position steel belts, tube type

1.00          0.00 0.00          0.00

. 
DISCOUNTS: 
 
BRIDGESTONE      30%

6 1000009094
TIRES: Loader and Grader

1.00          0.00 0.00          0.00

. 
DISCOUNTS: 
 
BRIDGESTONE        17%
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7 1000009080
TUBES: Light Truck

1.00          0.00 0.00          0.00

. 
NO BID

8 1000009081
TUBES: Medium Truck

1.00          0.00 0.00          0.00

. 
NO BID

9 1000009082
TIRES: Recycle Fee For Tires w/rim
Smaller than size 17-1/2

1.00          0.00 0.00          0.00

. 
$1.00 PER TIRE UNDER 17.5

Contract Base Pricing 2.50000 0001EA

10 1000009085
TIRES: Recycle Fee For Tires w/rim size
17-1/2 or larger

1.00          0.00 0.00          0.00

. 
18-19.5 OR LARGER   $2.50 
19.5 AND LARGER  $3.50

Contract Base Pricing 3.50000 0001EA

11 1000009086
TIRES: Pass. Mounting / Balancing

1.00          0.00 0.00          0.00

. 
$7.00/EACH

12 1000009084
TIRES: Lght Trck Mounting / Balancing

1.00          0.00 0.00          0.00

. 
$7.00/EACH

13 1000009087
TIRES: New stems installed, metal. 
PASSENGER CAR & TRUCKS

1.00          0.00 0.00          0.00

. 
NO BID

14 1000009088
TIRES: Wheel Alignment

1.00          0.00 0.00          0.00
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. 
NO BID

Contract Base Pricing 75.00000 0001EA

15 1000009089
TIRES: Markers and Supplies

1.00          0.00 0.00          0.00

. 
NO BID

COMMENTS:

. 
TIRES PRICES ACCORDING TO MANUFACTURERS PRICE LIST LISTED IN SEPARATE PDF FILE.
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