REP# 0900000564

SUPPLIER'S NAMF:

EXHIBIT 3 FlREFr!_GJ'ITER‘S EQUIPMENT - STATION WEAR

MARKET BASKET EVAL UATION WORKSHEET

anner fHre. Euuioment

Shits |51 Tactical Poly/Coiton Flesce % 7ip Sair Fach No Bid
Shits |51 Tactical Men's % Zip Shirt with Canvas Gollars nd Flbows Each Nc Bid
Shits |51 Tactical, Tactical 85 Pola Shirt Esch No Bid
Shirts 5.11 Tagtical Professional Long Sleave Polo Shirt Each No Bid
Shirts Propper Men's 1.G.E. Integrated Cooling Effect Performance Folo Each No Bid
Shits | LION StationWear, Bravo Shert Sleeve Uniform Shirt, Poly/Cotion Each No Bid
Shits  |LION StationWear: Bravo Short Steeve Unifom Shirl, NOMEX [4A Each No Bid
Shils  {EMeco: Textrop? Ladies Choloe Short Steeve Shirt Each No Bid
Shirts Elheco: Ufx Performance Tactical Women's Polo Each NO Bld
Shirls  |Worksite: Men's Classic Short Sleeve Fire Chief Sir Each No Bid
Fants  [TRU-SPEC: 247 Series, Poly-Cotton Ripsiop Men's Pants Each No Bid
Panis Workrite: Men's Classic Pant Each No Bid
Panis |51 Tacfcal Womer's Taclie EMS Pant Each No Bid
Panls 1511 Tactcal: TDU PolyCotton Tull Pans Each No Bid
Befis  |Boston Leather: 1-3/4" Gamison Belt - Leather Each No Bid
Belts Bosfon Leather: 1-1/2" Belt - Leather Fach No Bid
Bells  |5.11 Tacical: TDU Bells - Polymer Bucke, 1.5 or 1.75" Each No Bid
Hats Flexfit: Acrylic-Wool Low Profile Cap Each No Bid
Hais True Norih: OragonWear Nomex Fleece, Double Shot Hat Each No Bld
Hats Flaxfit: Heavyweight Cuffed Knit Cap Each No Bid
Hatﬁ:;'”m NoSweat: Disposable Hat & Helmet Linar Each NO Bld
Shaes/BO0tS | orogaud; ASR Black Leather Slip-Gn Shos Pair No Bid
Shoes/Boots Haix Alrpower R2 & Station/EMS Boot with Crosstech, Men's, NFPA Pair NO Bld
ShossBoats ;ziicgood: The Deuce §" Waterproof Side Zip w/ Composite Toe Staticn o N o B I d
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EXHIBIT 4 - STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTER'S EQUIPMENT

SUPPLIER'S NANE: ﬁ)ﬂf’?pf laye %U ﬁ;«)”}”)ﬁ’?-}—

MARKET BASKET EVALUATION WORKSHEET

Helmefs  |Gaitms NGA Houston Black Leather Helmet, OSHA Cerfifiad Each No Bid
Helmets  jCaims: N5A New Yorker Naturai Leather Helmet, OSHA Each No Bid
Helmets | Moming Pride: Ren 2 Low Rider Helmat NFPA 2013 Certified Fach Bullerd, Thermoplastic faceshield, www. builard.com PX $441.21 35 $286.78
et E;}Dntz;vﬂ: ;’;ﬁe} E\M Traditional Firafighting Helmet, with Internal EZ TouchFace Eye - Bullard, waditional mtie, faceshild www.bullard.com U STM 6 482 .52 3 5 3 1 3 ) 6 3
Helmets | Cairms: 1044 Helmet, Black, NFPA, OSHA Each Bullard, Fiberglass Faceshield, www.bullsrd.cam FX $423.59 35 $275.33
Hoods  |Majestic: PAG N, 100% Nomex, Black, NFPA 1971-2013 Each Majestic, 100% Nomex, Blaok, wwaw.majhcods.com PAC II n/a
Hoods  {PGI: Cobra™ Utiimats™ Carbon Shisld™ Hood, NFPA Certiied Each Majesiic, 100% Nomex, whits, www majhoods.cam PAC II n/a
Hoods Majestic: PAC If Ulra GG, SVZ, NFPA 1871-2013 Ezch Majestic, Uitra Carbon Knight, Black, www.majheods.com PACII nfa
Gloves  |Ergodyne ProFlex Fire & Rescue Performance Gloves Pair FireCraft, Phoenix Gauntlet cuff, www firecrattsafety.com P5000 $100 10 90.00
Glaves  |Fire Pro Il Structural Fire Glove Pair FireGraft, Phoenix, Knit Wilst cuff, www firecrafisafety.com P5000W $103 10 02,70
Gloves  |Pro Tach 8 Titan Kangareo Structural Glove, Short Cuff Pair Firecraft, Phoenix, gauntlet cuff, cadet, www firecrafisafety.com | P5000-Cadet] $100 10 a0
Gloves  |Fire Armor Structural Fire Glove Pair Firearall. Phoenix, Ktk Wrist cufl. cadat, worw frecraflsafeiy.com P5000W-Cadet | $103 10 92,70
Soume ;’5:—;&313 . TITANK Structural Firsfighting Glove, Kangaroo LeatherKevtar, NFPA 1671- - FireDex, DexcPro, Leather Gauntlet, wnw firedex com G 2 L $ 2 2 4 3 0 $1 56.80
Gloves  |Honsywell: Kangaroo Leather Cadet Size Super Glove, NFPA Pair FireDex, Dex-Pro, Leather Knit wrist www. firedex com G2N $224 30 $156.80
Gloves  [Veridian: Fire Amor Sfructural Firefighting Glove, NFPA Pair Innatex, 30 Black Kangareo, waw.mnotexprotection.com 8805 $245.20 15 $208.42
Gioves | Shelby 5292 Tuff Glove Structural Firefighting Glove with Gauntiet Pair oo, 3. Bk Kangaseo, g, wan mrsiepetecon.cem 8853 $232.80 15 $197.88
Eye Protection [Conway/lion: Faceshield, 4" x 150 Apec (Thumbwhee! Style) Each No Bid
Eys Protection |ConwayiLion: Faceshield Hardware, Thurmbwhesi Each No Bid
Eye Protection |Bullard: 8" Polycarbonate, Hard Coated Faceshield Each Builard 6" Polycarbanate Faceshield, www.bullard.com R325 $104.40 30 $73.08
Ey Protection |Bullard: Faceshield Mounting Hardwere Kit Each Bullard Faceshield mounting kit, wwiw.bullard.com R151 326.75 30 $18.72
Eye Protection [Innerzone 1 NFPA Goggle System With Mounting Brackets. Fach ESS- WWw.esseyepro.com 740-0264 $70.00 15 $59.50
Eya Protection |ESS: FirePro-1971 FS Stuctural Firefighting Goggle Kit, Ful Strap, NFPA 2013 Each ESS- www.esseyepro.com 740-0537 | $70.00 15 $59.50
Bocte | Hellfire Rubber Fell Insutaied Boot, Lug Sols Pair Thorogood Hellfire-www.thorogoodshees.com | 807-6003 | $304.00 15 $258.40
Beots  |Globe: Men's Supreme 14" Structural Fire Boot Pul-On, NFPA Pair FireDex Leather, www firedex.com FDXL200 |$796.00 30 $557.20
Boots Theragood: 14" Oblique Toe Structural Boot, NFPA Pair No Bid
Bools Pro Warringion: 5006 Ultimate Power 14" Bunker Boot, NFPA Pair Nao Bid
Boots Honeywell: Ranger Series Mode! 1500 insulated Rubber Boots, 16", NFPA Pair FireDex, Rubber-www.firedex.com FDXR-100 }$353.00 10 $317.70
Baots HAIX: FIRE HERO XTREME 11" Leather Bunker Boot, Mens, NFPA Pair MNa Bid
Boots | Globe Men's Shadow 14" Alblack Leather Structural Fire Baot, Pull-On, NFPA Pair Thorogood, Leather- www.thorogoodshoes.com|  804-6369 $644 35 $418.60




Boots  |Honeywell: Ranger Series Moded 1000 Insulated Rubber Buots, 15°, NFPA par | Thorogood- www.thorogoodshoss.com  |UNI-V2 $798 B35 $518.70
Boots | Thorogood Women's Rubber insulited Felt Fire Boot With Lug Sole, NFPA Peir Thorogood Hellfire-waww thorogoodshoes.com | 507-6003 |$304 |15 $258.4(C
Turnout Gear - ’ ) '
Coats Clobe: TheFireStore Spec Classix Coat Each NO Bld
Turnout Gear - | Fire-Dex: Nomex Il Deluxe Chieftain Express Tumout Gear Coat with Q8 Thermal Liner No Bid
Coats and Stedair 3000 Maisture Barrier Each 0 bl
Turnout Gear - [Morning Pride: TheFieStore Spec Structural Firefighting Bunker Gear, NFPA 1971 - N Bl d
Coals Jacket Each o
T it Gear - .
urngi atsear Lien: V-Force TFS, 32" Bi-Swing Tumout Coat Each No Bid
Turneut Gear- | 3 .
Costs Fire Dexc Gold FXA Express Coat, 7.2 oz Advance-Nomex/Keviar Each N 0 Bid
Turnout Gear - . i .
Parts Globe: TheFireStore Spec Classix Pants Pair NO Bid
Tumout Gear - | Fire-Dex: Nomex [ll Defuxe Chieftain Express Turnout Gear Pants with Q8 Thermal Liner .
Panis and Stedair 3000 Molsture Barrier Pair No Bid
Turnout Gear - |Fire-Dex: Gemini XT FX-M Express Tumout Gear Pants with Caldura SL2i Thermal Liner .
Pents | and Stedair 400G Molsture Barrier Par No Bid
Tumnout Gear - | Morning Pride: TheFiraStore Spes Structural Firefighting Bunker Gear, NEFPA 1971 - N B
Pants Pants Pair C Id
Tumout Gear- |, B
Pants |10 VForce TFS, Tumou Pents oair No Bid
Tools Fire Axe, Inc. LAFD Polished Steel Pick Head Firefighter Axe, 6 Ib. Each NO Bld
Tools Fire Hooks Unlimited 8 Ibs 38" Chrome Forcible Entry Axe with Marrying Slot, Tibargiass Each NO Bld
. g . No Bid
Taols Alron Roof Hock, Compact 17" All-Steef Mult-Fumose NY-siyle Hook, Fulerum Chisal Each
Taols  |Leatherhead NY-Style Hook wilh Asgled Chisel & Foot Ean  |Leatherhead- www leatherheadtools.com |NYH-6 184.00(20 147.20
Tools Aazel All-Stainless 1 Piece Forged Steel Halligan Bar Each NO Bld
Tools Council Single Forged Allow Steel Halligan Style Forcible Entry Tool Each Council, TD30 Halligan- www.counciliool.com AL 1 P30 287.55 15 244 41
Toals Tempesi Technology VentMasler Husavama Pro 576HD F[raiRgswe Chain Saw Each NO Bid
Tools Akron 58" Round or Square Point Shovels, Ulira-Lite Handle Fach NO B Id
Tools Counci Tool Sledge Hammer Each N ¢ Bld
Toals LoneStar Axe The PIG Forcibls Eniry Tool, §Ihs. Each NO B[d
Tools FireHooks Unlimited: FD-760 Forcible Entry Saw Each N o] Bld
Tools Channelfock The 88 Rescué Tool wilh Cable Cutier Each Brooks 87 n/a
Tools EM! Window Punch, Adjustable Tension Each NO B|d
Tools Emi First-in Rescue Kit Each No Bid
Tools Fire Hoeks Unlimited The Fireldast 14-in-1 Tool Each Fire Hooks Unlimited, www.firehooksunlimited net Firemx22 $1 74




RFP# 0900000564 EXHIBIT 5 - WJLDLAND FIREFIGHTER'S EGUIPMENT MARKET BASKET EVALUATION WORKSHEET

SUPPLIER'S NAME: timi’)éi’ ‘h‘f? % Lu‘ !Jf ﬂtgﬂ p
Boots Pro Warrington: 3003 8" Witdiand/Station Boot, NEPA 1977 Pair No Bid
Boots Haix: Airpower XR1 Dual-Certfied Wildland, EMS, Station Boot, NEPA Pair NO B[d
Baoots  |Thorogeods 10" Wildland Hellfire Fire Boot Pair Thoregood Lace Up- www.thorogoodshoss.com | sos-6370i504-6278 | 552 00 35 358.80
Boots Thoregeods 9" Hellfire Wildiand Beot Pair Thorogood Lace up-www.thorogoodshoes.com s04-6379/504-6379 | 552,00 35 - 358.80
Bools Thorogoods 10° Wildland Beot with Zippar Pair Thorogood Lace Up- www thorogoodshoes.com 804-6379/504-637¢ | 55200 35 358.58
Roots 10° Mt Structural TRIMldland Boot Pair No Bid
Boots |Harcules V2 9" Leather Wildfand Book Pair No Bid
e ;r;;;ech 8: Fusion Structural / Wildland Firefighting and Extrication Glove, - Rl ngers- WWW. ringersgloves com R327 69 ] 50 1 5 60.00 Bid
Gloves Shelby Pigskin Wildland/Rescue Glove Pair - No Bid
Pants FeldFire CrewBoss Nomex Brush Pant Pair Lakeland yellow smoke jumper pant- wuw.lakeland.com WLSPTNZ26 | 245.37 10 220.83
Pants Coaxsher CX Wildland Brush Pant Pair FireDex TecGen51- www firedex.com XP17 891 8 819,72
Pants Coaxsher CX Wildland Vent Brush Pant Pair No Bid
Pants Vector Witdland Fire Pant Pair No Bid
Pants X Wildland Vent Pant, Tecasafe Pair ) No Bid
Pants Crew Boss: Interface Brush Pants, NFPA ~ Pair FireDex Cover pants 7.5 Nomex- www.firedex.com § WCEPNOQPTP 521 10 468.90
Shirts Vector Wildiand Fire Shirt Each TecGen 51 fatigues- www.firedex.com XJ47 891 I 819,72
Shirts Coaxsher CX Wildiand Brush Shirt Each No Bid
Shirts Stryker Wildland Fire Shirt Each ' No Bid
Shirts Beta Wildland Fire Shirt Each No Bid
Shirts BetaX Wildland Fire Shirt Each No Bid
Jumpsuits  {Fireline Wildiand Jumpstit, 9 oz Indura Cotfon or 6 oz Nomex IlA Each FireDex Standard Coveralls- www firedex.com FS1000 944 10 849.60
CoalsfJackets |Coaxsher: CX Uthan Interface Coat Each No Bid
Coalshlackets |Veridian Limitad's Wildland Jacket : Each No Bid
CoatstJacksts |PGI Firafine Wildland Coat, Yellow Norex 1A Each Lakeland yellow smoke jumper coat- www.lakeland.com WLSCTN26 | 294.44 15 250.27
CoatsiJackeis | Crew Boss: interface Wildland/Urban Coat, NFPA 1877 Each : No Bid
Helmets Bullard Wildland Helmet Hat Each Bullard Full Brim with Namex ear/neck protector- www.bullard.com FHe1IHRR72AYL | 147.72 33 08 97
Heimets  |Phenix First Due Series WILDLAND Version - OSHA Compiiant Fach No Bid
Mask';’aSc;muds Hot Shield Wildland Firefighter Face Mask Each HDt Shleld_ WWW. hOtSh]eId .com H 8_2 85 -00 7 79 05




Face . .
MasksiStrouds |Hot Stiield UNIVV@ Ultia Shroud Sxtreme e |HOt Shield- www.hotshield.com UNI-V2 55.00 |5 52.25
Face .
Masks/Shrouds | CX Wildland Helmet Shroud Each 507-6003 No Bid
Goggles  [Wildland Fire Odyssey Il Goggles Each ESS-Fire Pro WWW. esseyepra.com 70.006 {15 59.50
Firefighting . i } E
Pumps Indian Backpack Firefighting Pumps-Galvarized Each BB Smith-Galvanized 906 -www. thefountainkeadgroup.com 1 790 '] 4-1 1 962._ 5 1 8643
Firafighting . ) ;
Pumps | Smith Incian Fire Pump, $teel Widland Fire Tank with Pump, 5 Gallon Each | ST 908 Sifrless Stecl wnew hetauntainhendgowpeom 117901517 | 293.7515 279.06
Firefighting | Smith 500 FSV Fedco SmokeChaser Collapsible Heavy Duty Vinyl Wildland . . r
Pumps  |Incian Fire Tank Beg wih Pump, 5 Callon e DB Smith-www.thefountainheadgroup.com 179061V 183.7¢15 155,56
Firefightiny Smith Indian Fire Pump, Chief 5-Gallon Heavy-Duty Dual Bag Nylon Fire . .
Pugnps * Pump ’ o ey e | DB Smith- www.thefountainhead.com 190654 241.25|15 229.18
Firefighting .
Pumps Hale Fyr Pak Backpack Pump Each No Bid
Df?p Totth | Forestry Suppiiers Sure-Seal Doubla-Botiom Drip Torch Each Forestry Suppliers- Pecosales.com 85066 173.001n 173 OO
Drip Torch  [Mercedes Textles Drip Torch, 1.2 US Gallon Capacity Each No Bid
Wildland Pack  [True North Spitfire Wikdland Pack Each No Bid
Wiidland Pack | Coaxsher SR-1 Endeavor Search and Rescus Pack Each No Bid
Wiidiand Pack | Goaxsher FS-1 Spotter Mid-Weight Wildiand Fire Pack Each No Bid
Wiidiand Pack_; Coaxsher F5-1 Ranger Wikdiand Firs Pack Each No Bid
Wildland Pack | Coaxshar F5-1 Majave Lightweight Wildiand Fire Pack Each No Bid
Wildland Pack |Ranger/Endeavor 1500ci Pack Each NGO Hid
Wildland Pack | Alpha-10 Firs Line Pack System Each No Bid
Foresi Fire . .
Protestion Shelter | Anchor Industries New Generation Fire Shelter Fach N 9] B id
Radio Holster, Hip .
, Radio Chest
oase aamawis o Coaxsher Mini Radio Holster Each N 0 BId
Radio Holster, Hip .
Case, Radio Chest | ] No Bid
Hamess Multi-Use Hip-Case Each
Radio Holster, Hip .
Case, Radio Chest N 0 B Ed
Harness Coaxsher DR-1 Commander Duat Radio Chest Harness Each
Tools |Councll Tools 3751 Pulaski Axe Each | Gouncl - wunw counciltool.com 38PE136F((152.32]1U 137.08
Tools Fire Haoks Unlimited Pulaski Axe with Fibergiass Handle Eash Fire Hooks- www firehooks.com PUL-AXE 2.0 0 72. 00
Toals Akron 58 Round or Square Point Shoveis, Ulira-Lite Handle Each Fire Hooks- www.firehooks.com S H U‘P55 66 00 O 66.00
Tools Akron MelLeod Wildland Fire Tool, 48" Wooden Handie Each Council Tool- www.counciltool.carn |V|T48-FSS 1 2972 1 0 116.7/4
Tools  |Council Pick & Shovel Combi-Teo! Each  |Coundl Tool www.councilicol.com Cl42FSS |163.86:i10 147.47
Tools Gouncii Tocl Forast Fire Rake Each Council Tool- www.councilteol.com LW1 2-60-F 6{4 70’ 10 5823
Tools Counil Tool McLesd Tool Each Council Took www coungiltool.com M1AB-FSS |[129 72 10 116.74
Tools Fire Hooks Unlimitad Wildland McCloud Tool Each Fire Hooks- WYY firehooks. com MLILF 84.00 0 84.00
Tools Fire Hooks Unlimited Brush Fire Broom, 5 Ft Length Each Fire Hooks- www.firehooks.com BBR-5 22.80 |. 22 80
Tools Fire Hooks Unfimited Brush Rake, 5 feet Each Fire Hooks- www firehooks. corr: AREF-5 57.60 [V Y/ BO
Tools | Counci Tool Fire Swatierw/ 60 Handie Fach  |Council Teal- www.councitool com FS15-F55 184.54 ho 76.08
Tools Nupla Single Fdge Bush Hook Each No Bid
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PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF MANUFACTURER'S LIST PRICE

SUPPLIERNAME: _ ¢ JLMIFIEY  PIVC. (=Sl ITIEY) =

Shirts No Bid
Pants No Bid
Belts No Bid
Hats No Bid
Hat & Helmet Liner No Bid
Shoes/Boots No Bid
Other items Not listed Above in Exhibit 3 Example .
Products NO Bld

Helmets Bullard~ 35

Hoods Majestic - 0, FireDex- 30
Gioves Innotex - 15, FireDeax- 30, FireCraft- 10
Eye Protection Builard-30, ESS-15

Boots Thorogood- 35, FireDex-30

Turnout Gear - Coats

Innotex-15, FireDex-45

Turnout Gear - Pants

Innotex-15, FireDex-45

Tools Carried/Utilized by Firefighters in Structural
Firefighting

Council- 1¢, Leatherhead-20, Fire Hooks-0, Flamefighter-25

Other items Not Listed Above in Exhibit 4 Example
Products

Draeger-13, Akron-30, Streamlight-10, Elkhart-25, TFT-G, Key<40, Bullard-5

Boots Tharogood-15, FireDex-10

Gloves FireDex-5, FireCraft-10

Pants Laksland-15

Shirts No Bid

Jumpsuits No Bid

Coats/Jackets l.akeland-15, FireDex-40

Helmets Bullard-35

Face Masks/Shrouds Hotshield-7

Gogglas ESS-15

Firefighting Pumps Class Orne- 20, CET-10

Drip Torch PECO- MSRP

Wildland Packs DB Smtih-5

Forest Fire Protection Shelier No Bid

Radio Holster, Hip Case, Radic Chest Harness Boston Leather-MSRP

Tools Councii-10, Leatherhead-20, FireHooks-0, Flamefighter-25
Other items Not Listed Above in Exhibit 5 Example

Products Akron-30, Harrington-20, Kochek-20
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